From: Craig W. Bulkley <Craig.Bulkley@liquor.state.nh.us>

Sent: Monday, July 29, 2013 9:53 PM
To: Nancy Lamarche

Subject: Laconia - RE: follow up to meeting
Nancy:

You may submit your comments to me via email. Thank you.

From: Nancy Lamarche [mailto:nancylamarchecpa@gmail.com]
Sent: Mon 7/29/2013 3:44 PM

To: Craig W. Bulkley

Subject: follow up to meeting

Hello Craig: There were two points of interest that were made at our July 23 meeting that | believe, to avoid any
confusion, warrant further comment. Would it be appropriate to submit them, or is it beyond the procedural protocol?

Best,
Nancy Lamarche
LBWD/Rateliner



From: Craig W. Bulkley <Craig.Bulkley@liquor.state.nh.us>

Sent: Friday, July 26, 2013 2:58 PM
To: Scott.Lyons@exel.com
Subject: Transportation Contract
Importance: High

Scott — yes, Jim Gehr needs to sign the contract before it goes to the AG. They must sign off on form and execution, so
all signatures must be present.

b% Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

Craig W. Bulkley

Director

Division of Administration

NH State Liquor Commission
|/ (603) 230-7008

FAX (603) 271-3897

Cell: (603) 490-1559

D4 cbulkley@liquor.state.nh.us

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it are confidential and are intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom
they are addressed. This communication may contain material protected by law. If you are not the intended recipient or the person
responsible for delivering the e-mail to the intended recipient, be advised that you have received this e-mail in error and that any
use, dissemination, forwarding, printing, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited and may be subject to criminal prosecution. If
you have received this e-mail in error, please destroy and immediately notify me by telephone at (603)230-7008.



Subject: Transportation RFP

Location: 877.777.1345 or 617.614.3333 / Passcode 65064697
Start: Fri 7/26/2013 1:10 PM

End: Fri 7/26/2013 1:40 PM

Show Time As: Tentative

Recurrence: (none)

Meeting Status: Not yet responded

Organizer: Scott Lyons (EXEL CA)

When: Friday, July 26, 2013 1:10 PM-1:40 PM (GMT-05:00) Eastern Time (US & Canada).
Where: 877.777.1345 or 617.614.3333 / Passcode 65064697

Note: The GMT offset above does not reflect daylight saving time adjustments.
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From: Craig W. Bulkley <Craig.Bulkley@liquor.state.nh.us>
Sent: Friday, July 26, 2013 10:15 AM

To: Scott Lyons (EXEL CA)

Subject: Accepted: Transportation RFP



Subject: Transportation RFP

Location: 877.777.1345 or 617.614.3333 / Passcode 65064697
Start: Fri 7/26/2013 11:15 AM

End: Fri 7/26/2013 11:45 AM

Show Time As: Tentative

Recurrence: (none)

Meeting Status: Not yet responded

Organizer: Scott Lyons (EXEL CA)

When: Friday, July 26, 2013 11:15 AM-11:45 AM (GMT-05:00) Eastern Time (US & Canada).
Where: 877.777.1345 or 617.614.3333 / Passcode 65064697

Note: The GMT offset above does not reflect daylight saving time adjustments.
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From: Scott Lyons (EXEL CA) <Scott.Lyons@exel.com>

Sent: Friday, July 26, 2013 10:13 AM
To: Craig W. Bulkley
Subject: RE: Phone Call This Morning

11:15is fine. | will update the meeting request.
Scott Lyons

Telephone: 905 366-7691
Mobile:

From: Craig W. Bulkley [mailto:cbulkley@Iliguor.state.nh.us]
Sent: Friday, July 26, 2013 9:41 AM

To: Scott Lyons (EXEL CA)

Subject: Phone Call This Morning

Importance: High

Scott — can we speak together about 11:15 AM this morning? Steve is tied up until then. Let me know and tell me if we
need to call into a number. Otherwise, I'll expect your call to my number about 11:15.

b% Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

Craig W. Bulkley

Director

Division of Administration

NH State Liquor Commission
& (603) 230-7008

FAX (603) 271-3897

Cell: (603) 490-1559

D4 cbulkley@liguor.state.nh.us

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it are confidential and are intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom
they are addressed. This communication may contain material protected by law. If you are not the intended recipient or the person
responsible for delivering the e-mail to the intended recipient, be advised that you have received this e-mail in error and that any
use, dissemination, forwarding, printing, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited and may be subject to criminal prosecution. If
you have received this e-mail in error, please destroy and immediately notify me by telephone at (603)230-7008.



From: Craig W. Bulkley <Craig.Bulkley@liquor.state.nh.us>

Sent: Friday, July 26, 2013 9:44 AM
To: Scott Lyons (EXEL CA)
Subject: New Time Proposed: Transportation RFP

Importance: High



From: Craig W. Bulkley <Craig.Bulkley@liquor.state.nh.us>

Sent: Friday, July 26, 2013 9:41 AM
To: Scott.Lyons@exel.com
Subject: Phone Call This Morning
Importance: High

Scott — can we speak together about 11:15 AM this morning? Steve is tied up until then. Let me know and tell me if we
need to call into a number. Otherwise, I'll expect your call to my number about 11:15.

b% Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

Craig W. Bulkley

Director

Division of Administration

NH State Liquor Commission
|/ (603) 230-7008

FAX (603) 271-3897

Cell: (603) 490-1559

D4 cbulkley@liquor.state.nh.us

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it are confidential and are intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom
they are addressed. This communication may contain material protected by law. If you are not the intended recipient or the person
responsible for delivering the e-mail to the intended recipient, be advised that you have received this e-mail in error and that any
use, dissemination, forwarding, printing, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited and may be subject to criminal prosecution. If
you have received this e-mail in error, please destroy and immediately notify me by telephone at (603)230-7008.



Subject: Transportation RFP

Location: 877.777.1345 or 617.614.3333 / Passcode 65064697
Start: Fri 7/26/2013 11:00 AM

End: Fri 7/26/2013 11:30 AM

Show Time As: Tentative

Recurrence: (none)

Meeting Status: Not yet responded

Organizer: Scott Lyons (EXEL CA)

When: Friday, July 26, 2013 11:00 AM-11:30 AM. (UTC-05:00) Eastern Time (US & Canada)
Where: 877.777.1345 or 617.614.3333 / Passcode 65064697
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Subject: Transportation RFP

Location: 877.777.1345 or 617.614.3333 / Passcode 65064697
Start: Fri 7/26/2013 10:00 AM

End: Fri 7/26/2013 10:30 AM

Show Time As: Tentative

Recurrence: (none)

Meeting Status: Not yet responded

Organizer: Scott Lyons (EXEL CA)

When: Friday, July 26, 2013 10:00 AM-10:30 AM. (UTC-05:00) Eastern Time (US & Canada)
Where: 877.777.1345 or 617.614.3333 / Passcode 65064697
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From: Craig W. Bulkley <Craig.Bulkley@liquor.state.nh.us>

Sent: Wednesday, July 24, 2013 7:52 AM
To: Brian Law
Subject: RE: Clarification regarding totes

Received; thank you

From: Brian Law [mailto:brianlaw@lawwarehouses.com]
Sent: Tuesday, July 23, 2013 7:45 PM

To: Craig W. Bulkley

Cc: John Guerette; John D. Bunnell; Lehmann, Suzan M.
Subject: Clarification regarding totes

Craig: As a follow up to our meeting, the exception we took concerning totes relates only to the scenario whereby the
NHSLC’s headquarters moves to a location which does not have dock access and thus would require totes to be hand
carried or transferred from the NHSLC offices to the truck by dolly or two-wheeler. In addition, the reference to store 1
was intended to reference the pick-up and unloading of totes when in the area of the NHSLC's current headquarters
(store 1 or the Concord warehouse). | did not intend to imply that the pick-up and delivery of totes was restricted to
store 1 loads. Should you have any further questions, please feel free to contact me at 603-759-7724 or by email.
Thank you.

Brian



From: Scott Lyons (EXEL CA) <Scott.Lyons@exel.com>

Sent: Tuesday, July 23, 2013 12:49 AM
To: Craig W. Bulkley
Subject: RE: Correction to My Email Dated 7/18/13

Received — Thanks.

Scott Lyons

Telephone: 905 366-7691
Mobile:

From: Craig W. Bulkley [mailto:cbulkley@Iliguor.state.nh.us]
Sent: Monday, July 22, 2013 1:31 PM

To: Scott Lyons (EXEL CA)

Subject: Correction to My Email Dated 7/18/13

Scott:
| made a typographical error in Paragraph Il of this email that read:

“Other documents required by the RFP will be part of the contract such as certificates of insurance, the
transition bond, the performance bond, a certificate of vote, a certificate of good standing, and a
warehouse license.”

This should read:

“Other documents required by the RFP will be part of the contract such as certificates of insurance, the
transition bond, the performance bond, a certificate of vote, a certificate of good standing, and a carrier
license.”

b% Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

Craig W. Bulkley

Director

Division of Administration

NH State Liquor Commission
= (603) 230-7008

FAX (603) 271-3897

Cell: (603) 490-1559

D4 cbulkley@liguor.state.nh.us

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE



This e-mail and any files transmitted with it are confidential and are intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom
they are addressed. This communication may contain material protected by law. If you are not the intended recipient or the person
responsible for delivering the e-mail to the intended recipient, be advised that you have received this e-mail in error and that any
use, dissemination, forwarding, printing, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited and may be subject to criminal prosecution. If
you have received this e-mail in error, please destroy and immediately notify me by telephone at (603)230-7008.



From: Jim Ryan <jryan@Ibbassociates.com>

Sent: Monday, July 22, 2013 1:35 PM

To: Craig W. Bulkley

Subject: RE: Correction to My Email Dated 7/18/13
Attachments: LB&B - NH State Liquior License.pdf
Craig,

Thanks much — we’re ready with the required documents.

Jim Ryan

Director of Business Development
LB&B Associates Inc.
9891Broken Land Parkway

Suite 400

Columbia, MD 21046

Office: 301-596-2440

Cell: 443-878-6122

Fax: 301-596-7879
http://www.lbbassociates.com/

The information contained in this message and any attachment may be proprietary,
confidential, and privileged or subject to the work product doctrine and thus protected
from disclosure. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, or an employee
or agent responsible for delivering this message to the intended recipient, you are hereby
notified that any dissemination, distribution, or copying of this communication is strictly
prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify me immediately
by replying to this message and deleting it and all copies and backups thereof. Thank you.

From: Craig W. Bulkley [mailto:cbulkley@Iliguor.state.nh.us]
Sent: Monday, July 22, 2013 1:32 PM

To: Jim Ryan

Subject: Correction to My Email Dated 7/18/13

Jim:
| made a typographical error in Paragraph Il of this email that read:

“Other documents required by the RFP will be part of the contract such as certificates of insurance, the
transition bond, the performance bond, a certificate of vote, a certificate of good standing, and a
warehouse license.”

This should read:
“Other documents required by the RFP will be part of the contract such as certificates of insurance, the

transition bond, the performance bond, a certificate of vote, a certificate of good standing, and a carrier
license.”



b% Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

Craig W. Bulkley

Director

Division of Administration

NH State Liquor Commission
& (603) 230-7008

FAX (603) 271-3897

Cell: (603) 490-1559

D4 cbulkley@liguor.state.nh.us

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it are confidential and are intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom
they are addressed. This communication may contain material protected by law. If you are not the intended recipient or the person
responsible for delivering the e-mail to the intended recipient, be advised that you have received this e-mail in error and that any
use, dissemination, forwarding, printing, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited and may be subject to criminal prosecution. If
you have received this e-mail in error, please destroy and immediately notify me by telephone at (603)230-7008.



State of New Hampshire
Liquor Commission

i

LB&B ASSOCIATES INC

LB&B ASSOCIATES INC

9891 BROKEN LAND PARKWAY, SUITE 400
COLUMBIA MD 21046

CARRIER OFF-PREMISES BEVERAGE/WINE/LIQUOR

License No. .NMN—.H H @ Effective Date: CM\HW\NQH—M Expires: @H\u H\NQHN—.

This license is issued and is subject to the conditions prescribed in Title XIII of the revised statutes annotated and regulations enacted by
the commission thereunder. This license is effective for the period specified above unless sooner revoked and is not transferable.

State Liquor Commission

Mg

. Mollica, Chairman Michael R. Milligan, Commi

Joseph er

This document and any addendum must be conspicuously displayed on the described premises. AUDIT NO. 463125




From: Craig W. Bulkley <Craig.Bulkley@liquor.state.nh.us>

Sent: Monday, July 22, 2013 1:32 PM

To: nancylamarchecpa@gmail.com
Subject: Correction to My Email Dated 7/18/13
Nancy:

| made a typographical error in Paragraph Il of this email that read:

“Other documents required by the RFP will be part of the contract such as certificates of insurance, the
transition bond, the performance bond, a certificate of vote, a certificate of good standing, and a
warehouse license.”

This should read:

“Other documents required by the RFP will be part of the contract such as certificates of insurance, the
transition bond, the performance bond, a certificate of vote, a certificate of good standing, and a carrier
license.”

b% Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

Craig W. Bulkley

Director

Division of Administration

NH State Liquor Commission
|/ (603) 230-7008

FAX (603) 271-3897

Cell: (603) 490-1559

D4 cbulkley@liguor.state.nh.us

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it are confidential and are intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom
they are addressed. This communication may contain material protected by law. If you are not the intended recipient or the person
responsible for delivering the e-mail to the intended recipient, be advised that you have received this e-mail in error and that any
use, dissemination, forwarding, printing, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited and may be subject to criminal prosecution. If
you have received this e-mail in error, please destroy and immediately notify me by telephone at (603)230-7008.



From: Craig W. Bulkley <Craig.Bulkley@liquor.state.nh.us>

Sent: Monday, July 22, 2013 1:32 PM

To: Jim Ryan

Subject: Correction to My Email Dated 7/18/13
Jim:

| made a typographical error in Paragraph Il of this email that read:

“Other documents required by the RFP will be part of the contract such as certificates of insurance, the
transition bond, the performance bond, a certificate of vote, a certificate of good standing, and a
warehouse license.”

This should read:

“Other documents required by the RFP will be part of the contract such as certificates of insurance, the
transition bond, the performance bond, a certificate of vote, a certificate of good standing, and a carrier
license.”

b% Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

Craig W. Bulkley

Director

Division of Administration

NH State Liquor Commission
|/ (603) 230-7008

FAX (603) 271-3897

Cell: (603) 490-1559

D4 cbulkley@liguor.state.nh.us

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it are confidential and are intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom
they are addressed. This communication may contain material protected by law. If you are not the intended recipient or the person
responsible for delivering the e-mail to the intended recipient, be advised that you have received this e-mail in error and that any
use, dissemination, forwarding, printing, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited and may be subject to criminal prosecution. If
you have received this e-mail in error, please destroy and immediately notify me by telephone at (603)230-7008.



From: Craig W. Bulkley <Craig.Bulkley@liquor.state.nh.us>

Sent: Monday, July 22, 2013 1:32 PM

To: brianlaw@lawwarehouses.com
Subject: Correction to My Email Dated 7/18/13
Brian:

| made a typographical error in Paragraph Il of this email that read:

“Other documents required by the RFP will be part of the contract such as certificates of insurance, the
transition bond, the performance bond, a certificate of vote, a certificate of good standing, and a
warehouse license.”

This should read:

“Other documents required by the RFP will be part of the contract such as certificates of insurance, the
transition bond, the performance bond, a certificate of vote, a certificate of good standing, and a carrier
license.”

b% Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

Craig W. Bulkley

Director

Division of Administration

NH State Liquor Commission
|/ (603) 230-7008

FAX (603) 271-3897

Cell: (603) 490-1559

D4 cbulkley@liguor.state.nh.us

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it are confidential and are intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom
they are addressed. This communication may contain material protected by law. If you are not the intended recipient or the person
responsible for delivering the e-mail to the intended recipient, be advised that you have received this e-mail in error and that any
use, dissemination, forwarding, printing, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited and may be subject to criminal prosecution. If
you have received this e-mail in error, please destroy and immediately notify me by telephone at (603)230-7008.



From: Craig W. Bulkley <Craig.Bulkley@liquor.state.nh.us>

Sent: Monday, July 22, 2013 1:31 PM

To: Scott.Lyons@exel.com

Subject: Correction to My Email Dated 7/18/13
Scott:

| made a typographical error in Paragraph Il of this email that read:

“Other documents required by the RFP will be part of the contract such as certificates of insurance, the
transition bond, the performance bond, a certificate of vote, a certificate of good standing, and a
warehouse license.”

This should read:

“Other documents required by the RFP will be part of the contract such as certificates of insurance, the
transition bond, the performance bond, a certificate of vote, a certificate of good standing, and a carrier
license.”

b% Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

Craig W. Bulkley

Director

Division of Administration

NH State Liquor Commission
|/ (603) 230-7008

FAX (603) 271-3897

Cell: (603) 490-1559

D4 cbulkley@liguor.state.nh.us

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it are confidential and are intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom
they are addressed. This communication may contain material protected by law. If you are not the intended recipient or the person
responsible for delivering the e-mail to the intended recipient, be advised that you have received this e-mail in error and that any
use, dissemination, forwarding, printing, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited and may be subject to criminal prosecution. If
you have received this e-mail in error, please destroy and immediately notify me by telephone at (603)230-7008.



From: Nancy Lamarche <nancylamarchecpa@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, July 22, 2013 9:46 AM

To: Craig W. Bulkley

Subject: Laconia - Best & Final Offer; Letter of Confirmation in response to NHSLC email of 7/18
Attachments: Ibwd rev finc 072213 .xlsx

Mr. Craig W. Bulkley
Director

Division of Administration
NH State Liquor Commission

Re: Letter of Confirmation in response to NHSLC email of 7/18

l. Pricing

1. BAFO. See reissued spreadsheet together with amended licensee option footnotes.

2. Asrequested under NHLC cover of July 18, this is to confirm that rates are fixed for the initial five
(5) year term, subject to RFP Exhibit K- fsc schedule: see spreadsheet footnote.

I. Final Contract

1. Exceptions: RFP or P-37

a) 1.5.8, pg 8 Inspection of Records.
Vendor wishes to register exception: no three year tenure audited statements.

b) 1.19.6, pg 14 Additions to Standard Contract Terms and Conditions.
Vendor reserves the right to negotiate further terms and conditions to
standard NHLC transportation contract.

c) Part 2, 2.5, pg 18 Separate Second Proposal for co-mingling licensee deliveries. Vendor
registers exception to the RFP requisite “sealed trailer” method. The Rateliner proposal
falls squarely on a pallet seal integrity system rather than trailer seal system.

d) Appendix C General Requirements 1.f, pg 30 Exception: The Rateliner proposal falls
squarely on a pallet seal integrity system rather than trailer seal system.

e) Appendix C. General Requirements 19, pg 32 Exception: The Rateliner proposal falls
squarely on a pallet seal integrity system rather than trailer seal system.

1



f) Special Requirements: 6, pg 34 Exception registered as to exclusively “roll up” doors.

Respectfully Submitted,

Nancy Lamarche
LBWD/Rateliner



LACONIA BWD RATE PROPOSAL SUMMARY

ACTUAL ESTIMATED APPENDIX-D APPENDIX D-1 APPENDIX D-2 APPENDIX D-3
CASE VOLUME CASE VOLUME NO CO-MINGLING + LICENSEE DELIVERIES MULTIPLE DELIVERY ZONES
5/1/12-4/30/13  11/1/13-1/31/19 M-F Wknd/Hol M-F Wknd/Hol M-F Wknd/Hol M-F Wknd/Hol
BEVERAGE CASES: Pallet Unload S 0.650 $ 0.650 S 0625 $ 0625 $ 065 $ 065 $ 060 S 0.60
Hand Unload S 0.775 $ 0775 S 0750 $ 0750 $ 065 S 065 S 060 S 0.60
MOVEMENT: Nashua - Bow S 0.500 $ 0.500 S 0500 S 0500 S 065 S 065 S 060 S 0.60
Concord - Bow S 0250 $ 0250 S 0250 $ 0250 $ 065 $ 065 $ 060 S 0.60
Totes & Supplies: To and From Stores - - - - - - - -
Product at Concord Whse to Bow Whse - - - - - - - -
Pallets - Unuseable & empty boxes - - - - - - - -
SUMMARY OF CASES & COSTS:
Pallet Total 2,534,558 14,450,000 S 9,392,500 S 9,031,250
Hand Total 1,044,786 5,120,000 S 3,968,000 S 3,840,000
Total Cases 3,579,344 19,570,000
Total Annual Cost S 13,360,500 S 12,871,250
Movement:
Nashua - Bow 500,000 500,000 S 250,000 S 250,000
Concord - Bow 40,000 40,000 S 10,000 S 10,000
Est. Total Movement Cases 540,000 540,000
S 260,000 S 260,000
GRANT TOTAL: $ 13,620,500 $ 13,131,250

Additional Notes:

Case volume utilized for this analysis is based on historical activity from 5/1/2012 - 4/30/2013.

Estimated case volume includes future annual growth of approximately 3%

Rates based on fuel purchase cost of $3.50 (RFP - Appendix K, pg.70)

To quantify, Vendor interprets the above line reference to mean that the D and/or D-1 rates are subject

to Appendix K fsc. Vendor now confirms that above rates are subject to Appendix K fsc schedule.

Liscensee Footnote: Original Note 1 and Note 2 footnotes pertaining to licensee option(s) have been amended as attached.



Footnotes: New Pricing Proposal

Note 1: Second Amendment (of 7/22) to Appendix D Pricing:

Rates are subject to the NHLC reservation of right, but not the obligation, to utilize the
Rateliner service as to any amount of Licensee deliveries it wishes to proffer to Rateliner at
the rate of .775 per case, subject to a $32.00 minimum charge per shipment. This right is not
contingent upon the NHLC payment of freight services: vendor will perform licensee delivery
services (tues-fri) on a collect shipment (fob origin) basis at same rate if, and only if the NHLC
stipulates to route a shipment via Rateliner. Appendix D rates, as amended, does not amend
the basic substance of the Rateliner original RFP proposal, as amended D rates are not
contingent upon the any NHLC obligation to include licensee deliveries as a condition
precedent to new D rates themselves. Vis: rates are not subject to the inclusion of any
amount of licensee deliveries if the NHLC deems not applicable, not viable or outside of the
envelope of the original RFP bid construct. ALL LICENSEE DELIVERY SERVICES ARE SUBJECT TO
THE NHLC APPENDIX K FSC SCHEDULE.

Note 2: Second Amendment (of 7/22) to Appendix D-1 Pricing:

Rates are subject to the co-terminus NHLC award of not less than 500,000 licensee case
deliveries per year at the rate of .75 per case, subject to a 30.00 minimum charge. Closely
parallel to Note 1 (D rates), Rateliner will honor the .75/cs D-1 rates whether shipped prepaid
or collect, subject to D-1's minimum annual aggregate total licensee tender of 500K cs per
annum. NHLC may ship fob Bow/collect or prepaid as it chooses. No change in POS (fob
origin) licensee terms. ALL LICENSEE DELIVERY SERVICES ARE SUBJECT TO THE NHLC
APPENDIX K FSC SCHEDULE.



